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EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. Bid 2985 

Bid 2985 Custodial Supplies for Warehouse Stock 
RESPONSE DEADLINE: April 22, 2024 at 2:00 pm 

Report Generated:  Tuesday, May 28, 2024 
 
TABLE 1  (Table 1 of 2) 
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Brady Industries Central Poly-Bag Corp. HD SUPPLY FACILITIES 
MAINTENANCE LP 

INTERBORO PACKAGING 
CORPORATION 

Line 
Item 

Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom 

1 1210063 BAGS, 
TRASH, 40+ GAL, 
CLEAR PLASTIC, 

23"X17"X46", CS/200, 
STAR BOTTOM, 1.5 

MIL (WEIGHT 36.8 LB 
WITHOUT THE 

BOX)**MUST BE 
PALLETIZED FOR CUSD 

DELIVERY** 
,***1210063 99 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL. 01 
PSL-4046-15C 02 

CENTRAL POLY_(nov 
2017 do not re-order) 

03 UPC 456CL 
(DISTRICT STANDARD) 

04 CP231746NXH 

500 CS $35.84 Oceania LR404615C-
200 

$35.90 Central 
Poly  No Bid   $34.34 INT-

231746-
XH 

As per sample 
#1 Mfr: 

IBS/Pitt/Glopak 
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 Brady Industries Central Poly-Bag Corp. HD SUPPLY FACILITIES 
MAINTENANCE LP 

INTERBORO PACKAGING 
CORPORATION 

Line 
Item 

Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom 

2 1210077 BAGS, 
TRASH, 40+ GAL, 

BLACK 23"X17"X46", 
CS/200, STAR 

BOTTOM 1.5 MILS 
ONLY ( WEIGHT OF 
36.8 LBS WITHOUT 

THE BOX) **MUST BE 
PALLETIZED FOR CUSD 

DELIVERY** 
,***1210077 99 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL. 01 
UPC 4048C15B-STAR 9 
DISTRICT STANDARD) 

02 POLYSTAR PSL-
4046-15B, BLACK 03 
CENTRAL POLY ( Nov 

2017 do not re-order) 
04 INT-231746-EXH 
NOT STAR BOTTOM 

1000 CS $35.90 Oceania REP-
404615B 

$31.95 Central 
Poly  No Bid   $30.74 INT-

231746-
Exh 

As per sample 
#2 Mfr: 

IBS/Pitt/Glopak 

3 1210090 PAPER 
TOWEL, 8"X800', 

BROWN, ROLL CS/6 ( 
MUST BE PALLETIZED 

FOR CUSD 
DELIVERY)***1210090 
01 GP 26301( 55 CASE 
PER PALLET) DISTICT 

STANDARD) 03 WAXIE 
3800 CLEAN & sOFT _ 

NOT ACCEPTABLE 

3000 CS $33.90 Georgia Pacific 
26301 

PI9002 $29.55 Marcal  $33.14 GPT26301  No Bid   
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 Brady Industries Central Poly-Bag Corp. HD SUPPLY FACILITIES 
MAINTENANCE LP 

INTERBORO PACKAGING 
CORPORATION 

Line 
Item 

Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom 

4 1210159 BAG, 
VACUUM, PAPER, FOR 

PROTEAM 
SUPERCOACH 

BAKPACK VACUUM, 
10 QT, 

10/PKG***1210159 
02 PROTEAM 

100331(NO SUBS) 03 
RENOWN REN08051 

EQUIVALENT TO 
100331 

500 PK $10.56 Pro-Team PT100331 No Bid   $9.35 REN08051  No Bid   

5 1210160 BAG, 
VACUUM,TRIANNGLE 
PAPER, PROTEAM 10 

QT , 
10/PK***1210160 01 

PRO TEAM 99 OR 
EQUAL 02 REN 08068 

03 PT-PRO/10QT 

400 PKG $10.56 Pro-Team PT107313 No Bid   $9.35 REN08068  No Bid   
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6 1211442 TOILET 
TISSUE, ROLL, WHITE, 

SINGLE PLY, 1500 
SHEET ROLL, SHEET 
SIZE 3.9 "X4.00", 48 
ROLL/CASE **MUST 
BE PALLETIZED FOR 
CUSD DELIVERY** 

,***1211442 99 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL. 01 

TOWEL SAVER 
NEVEROUT 18N -- 

1500/ROLL-48 02 FT. 
HOWARD #142 -- 

1500/ROLL-45 RL/CS 
03 #020 ROLLMASTER 

48 ROLL/CS 1500 
SHTS/RL 04 JAMES 

RIVER #020 05 JAMES 
RIVER 18N 06 FORT 

JAMES 07 ALLIED 
WEST #585 **NOT 
ACCEPTABLE** 08 
GEORGIA PACIFIC 
02002 - SAME AS 

19020 (discontinued) 
09 SCA 

#TS1624**NOT 
ACCEPTABLE*** 10 
GEORGIA PACIFIC 

19020(discontinued) - 
(18 CASES PER 

PALLET) 11 E-POLY 
PAPER STAR TP-1500-

IP48(NOT 
ACCEPTABLE) 12 

GEORGIA PACIFIC PRO 
ENVISION 14448/01 ( 
DISTRICT STANDARD) 

13 TORK 112990 - 
NOT ACCEPTABLE 14 
MORCO PAPER M125 

NOT ACCEPTABLE - 

1200 CS $55.05 Georgia Pacific 
14448/01 

PA9105 No Bid   $53.85 GPT14448-
01  No Bid   
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 Brady Industries Central Poly-Bag Corp. HD SUPPLY FACILITIES 
MAINTENANCE LP 

INTERBORO PACKAGING 
CORPORATION 

Line 
Item 

Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom 

CORE TOO SMALL 15 
FB-2748BR LILY SOFT 

IS 2PL Y - NOT 
ACCEPTABLE 

7 1211126 BAGS, 
SANITARY NAPKIN 

DISPOSAL***1211126 
01 IMPACT 260 

#30c0431 02 
HOSPECO C-250K 03 
WAXIE 820715 _( DO 

NOT REORDER 04 
ROCHESTER 05 

HOSPECO HS260( 
500/CASE ) DO NOT 

REORDER 06 
HOSPECO HS6141 07 

HOSPECO P01260 

75 CS $17.90 Hospeco PO1260 $69.77 Hospeco  $19.99 HOSKL-260  No Bid   

8 1211101 BAG, TRASH, 
36 QT 24X32,, .45 MIL 

STAR BOTTOM, 
500/CS***1211101 
01 POLYSTAR PSL-

2432-45B 02 
WARDLEY STAR 

BOTTOM 03 CENTRAL 
REP-2432 04 

ALLSTATE 06 INT 
2432-HVY 07 

243245LDBK BLACK 

210 CS $15.50 Oceania REP-2432 $21.66 Central 
Poly  No Bid   $15.48 INT-

2432-
Hvy 

As per sample 
#8 Mfr: 

IBS/Pitt/Glopak 
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 Brady Industries Central Poly-Bag Corp. HD SUPPLY FACILITIES 
MAINTENANCE LP 

INTERBORO PACKAGING 
CORPORATION 

Line 
Item 

Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom Unit 
Cost 

Brand Custom 

9 1219500 SOAP, HAND, 
LIQUID,FOAMING, 

GALLON # 1219500 01 
GENLABS FOAMING 
SOAP 02 CENTRAL 

MAINTEX 03 
CHEMCOR 04 

GENLABS GLS090604-
16 05 EX-H2131 

1200 GAL $7.00 Betco/Individual SCHSO11 No Bid   $6.67 GLS090604-
016  No Bid   

10 1211120 SEATCOVER, 
1/2 FOLD, 

CS/5000***1211120 
01 LIFEGUARD 02 

GENERIC 03 
ROCHESTER 04 

CENTRAL 046 05 
FOCUS BRAND 06 

HOSPECO 851557 07 
SW#8653C 08 

CENTRAL INTEGRITY 
09 MOREXT TSC20250 
10 HFOLD5000 11 GP 

47046 12 ROYALTY 
RPHFTSC20P 13 

30930283 

200 CS $22.00 Fengcheng 
Zhonghe 

PM0100 No Bid   $27.99 309330283  No Bid   
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 ODP Business Solutions PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Unipak Corp. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom 

1 1210063 BAGS, 
TRASH, 40+ GAL, 
CLEAR PLASTIC, 

23"X17"X46", CS/200, 
STAR BOTTOM, 1.5 

MIL (WEIGHT 36.8 LB 
WITHOUT THE 

BOX)**MUST BE 
PALLETIZED FOR CUSD 

DELIVERY** 
,***1210063 99 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL. 01 
PSL-4046-15C 02 

CENTRAL POLY_(nov 
2017 do not re-order) 

03 UPC 456CL 
(DISTRICT STANDARD) 

04 CP231746NXH 

500 CS $36.56 Pitt Plastics LINER LD 
40x46 

1.5MIL CLR 
125 

No Bid   $35.16 UPC 456CL  
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 ODP Business Solutions PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Unipak Corp. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom 

2 1210077 BAGS, 
TRASH, 40+ GAL, 

BLACK 23"X17"X46", 
CS/200, STAR 

BOTTOM 1.5 MILS 
ONLY ( WEIGHT OF 
36.8 LBS WITHOUT 

THE BOX) **MUST BE 
PALLETIZED FOR CUSD 

DELIVERY** 
,***1210077 99 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL. 01 
UPC 4048C15B-STAR 9 
DISTRICT STANDARD) 

02 POLYSTAR PSL-
4046-15B, BLACK 03 
CENTRAL POLY ( Nov 

2017 do not re-order) 
04 INT-231746-EXH 
NOT STAR BOTTOM 

1000 CS $32.08 Pitt Plastics LINER LD 
40x46 

1.5MIL BLK 
100 

No Bid   $30.99 UPC 
4048C15B  

3 1210090 PAPER 
TOWEL, 8"X800', 

BROWN, ROLL CS/6 ( 
MUST BE PALLETIZED 

FOR CUSD 
DELIVERY)***1210090 
01 GP 26301( 55 CASE 
PER PALLET) DISTICT 

STANDARD) 03 WAXIE 
3800 CLEAN & sOFT _ 

NOT ACCEPTABLE 

3000 CS $22.63 Highmark 
Professional 

TOWEL ROLL 
800' 6/CA 
NATURAL 

No Bid   No Bid   
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 ODP Business Solutions PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Unipak Corp. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom 

4 1210159 BAG, 
VACUUM, PAPER, FOR 

PROTEAM 
SUPERCOACH 

BAKPACK VACUUM, 
10 QT, 

10/PKG***1210159 
02 PROTEAM 

100331(NO SUBS) 03 
RENOWN REN08051 

EQUIVALENT TO 
100331 

500 PK $8.42 Janitized BAG VAC 
10QT 

PROTEAM 
100CT 

No Bid   No Bid   

5 1210160 BAG, 
VACUUM,TRIANNGLE 
PAPER, PROTEAM 10 

QT , 
10/PK***1210160 01 

PRO TEAM 99 OR 
EQUAL 02 REN 08068 

03 PT-PRO/10QT 

400 PKG $8.42 Janitized BAG VAC 
10QT 

PROTEAM 
100CT 

No Bid   No Bid   
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6 1211442 TOILET 
TISSUE, ROLL, WHITE, 

SINGLE PLY, 1500 
SHEET ROLL, SHEET 
SIZE 3.9 "X4.00", 48 
ROLL/CASE **MUST 
BE PALLETIZED FOR 
CUSD DELIVERY** 

,***1211442 99 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL. 01 

TOWEL SAVER 
NEVEROUT 18N -- 

1500/ROLL-48 02 FT. 
HOWARD #142 -- 

1500/ROLL-45 RL/CS 
03 #020 ROLLMASTER 

48 ROLL/CS 1500 
SHTS/RL 04 JAMES 

RIVER #020 05 JAMES 
RIVER 18N 06 FORT 

JAMES 07 ALLIED 
WEST #585 **NOT 
ACCEPTABLE** 08 
GEORGIA PACIFIC 
02002 - SAME AS 

19020 (discontinued) 
09 SCA 

#TS1624**NOT 
ACCEPTABLE*** 10 
GEORGIA PACIFIC 

19020(discontinued) - 
(18 CASES PER 

PALLET) 11 E-POLY 
PAPER STAR TP-1500-

IP48(NOT 
ACCEPTABLE) 12 

GEORGIA PACIFIC PRO 
ENVISION 14448/01 ( 
DISTRICT STANDARD) 

13 TORK 112990 - 
NOT ACCEPTABLE 14 
MORCO PAPER M125 

NOT ACCEPTABLE - 

1200 CS $53.49 Georgia 
Pacific  No Bid   No Bid   
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 ODP Business Solutions PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Unipak Corp. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom 

CORE TOO SMALL 15 
FB-2748BR LILY SOFT 

IS 2PL Y - NOT 
ACCEPTABLE 

7 1211126 BAGS, 
SANITARY NAPKIN 

DISPOSAL***1211126 
01 IMPACT 260 

#30c0431 02 
HOSPECO C-250K 03 
WAXIE 820715 _( DO 

NOT REORDER 04 
ROCHESTER 05 

HOSPECO HS260( 
500/CASE ) DO NOT 

REORDER 06 
HOSPECO HS6141 07 

HOSPECO P01260 

75 CS $27.68 Rochester 
Midland 

Rochester 
Midland 

Sanitary Wax 
Paper Liners, 

Carton Of 
500 

$20.98 HOSPECO 
#KL260 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 50 

CASES** 

No Bid   

8 1211101 BAG, TRASH, 
36 QT 24X32,, .45 MIL 

STAR BOTTOM, 
500/CS***1211101 
01 POLYSTAR PSL-

2432-45B 02 
WARDLEY STAR 

BOTTOM 03 CENTRAL 
REP-2432 04 

ALLSTATE 06 INT 
2432-HVY 07 

243245LDBK BLACK 

210 CS $15.06 Pitt Plastics LINER 24x32 
.45MIL WHT 

500CA 

No Bid   No Bid   
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 ODP Business Solutions PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS Unipak Corp. 

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of 
Measure 

Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom Unit Cost Brand Custom 

9 1219500 SOAP, HAND, 
LIQUID,FOAMING, 

GALLON # 1219500 01 
GENLABS FOAMING 
SOAP 02 CENTRAL 

MAINTEX 03 
CHEMCOR 04 

GENLABS GLS090604-
16 05 EX-H2131 

1200 GAL $14.12 Betco 
Industries 

Betco Green 
Earth 

Foaming Skin 
Cleanser, 
Fragrance 

Free, 1 
Gallon, Pack 
Of 4 Bottles 

No Bid   No Bid   

10 1211120 SEATCOVER, 
1/2 FOLD, 

CS/5000***1211120 
01 LIFEGUARD 02 

GENERIC 03 
ROCHESTER 04 

CENTRAL 046 05 
FOCUS BRAND 06 

HOSPECO 851557 07 
SW#8653C 08 

CENTRAL INTEGRITY 
09 MOREXT TSC20250 
10 HFOLD5000 11 GP 

47046 12 ROYALTY 
RPHFTSC20P 13 

30930283 

200 CS $27.29 Impact 
Products 

Half-Fold 
Toilet Seat 

Covers, 250 
Sheets Per 

Pack, Carton 
Of 20 Packs 

$30.69 HOSPECO 
#DS5000 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 120 

CASES** 

No Bid   

 


