... |pradylndustries |Central Poly-Bag Corp. |HDSupply |INTERBORO PACKAGING JERRY KELLY, INC./DBA |Microfiber Wholesale |PYRAMID SCHOOL PROD|Southwest School & OfficUnipak Corp. | Waxie Sanitary Supply
Unit Cost Unit Cost
1210063 BAGS, TRASH, 40+ GAL, CLEAR PLASTIC,
23"X17"X46", CS/200, STAR BOTTOM, 1.5 MIL
(WEIGHT 36.8 LB WITHOUT THE BOX)**MUST BE
PALLETIZED FOR CUSD DELIVERY** ,***1210063
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 PSL-4046-15C
02 CENTRAL POLY_(nov 2017 do not re-order)
03 UPC 456CL
1 04 CP231746NXH 900 CS S42.48 $40.90 No Bid $39.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid S48.67
1210076 BAGS, TRASH, 20-30 GAL, PLASTIC
16X14X36", STAR BOTTOM, CS/250 1.5 MILS ONLY
**MUST BE PALLETIZED FOR CUSD DELIVERY**
,¥*¥*1210076
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
03 ALLSTATE
04 CENTRAL POLY REP161436-30 GAL
2 06 ERNEST 20 CS
1210077 BAGS, TRASH, 40+ GAL, BLACK
23"X17"X46", CS/200, STAR BOTTOM 1.5 MILS
ONLY ( WEIGHT OF 36.8 LBS WITHOUT THE BOX)
**MUST BE PALLETIZED FOR CUSD DELIVERY**
,¥*¥*1210077
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 UPC 4048C15B-STAR
3 02 POLYSTAR PSL-4046-15B, BLACK 800 CS $37.90 $33.90 No Bid $31.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $43.38
1210081 PLASTIC BOTTLE,32 OZ, W/TRIGGER W/
GRADUATED 0Z, W/ 922H TRIGGER ,***1210081
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 TOLCO HO042 & TOLCO H043
02 IMPACT
03 CONTINENTAL 932GG W/ TOLCO 110221
04 CONTINENTAL C-932BT22
05 CONTINENTAL 932CG/902BW9
06 IMPACT TRIGGER/RENOWN BOTTLE
4 07 RENOWN IMP 1210125 AND RENOWN 300 EA $1.30 No Bid
1210090 PAPER TOWEL, 8"X800', BROWN, ROLL
CS/6 ( MUST BE PALLETIZED FOR CUSD
DELIVERY)***1210090
01 GP 26301( 55 CASE PER PALLET) DISTICT
STANDARD)
5 03 WAXIE 3800 CLEAN & sOFT _ NOT ACCEPTABLE 3520 CS
1210110 BROOM, JANITOR, STRAW, #1
,¥**1210110
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 NAT'L BROOM #1150
02 NSS JANITOR 4861
04 BYTECH JANITOR
05 PIONEER
06 AMERICAN BRENNER
07 CENTRAL BRAND
08 PREMIER 60201
09 ACS B406
10 WILEN E504025
6 11 RUBBERMAID FG 6384 30 EA $6.99 No Bid
1210158 BAG, VACUUM, CLOTH, FOR PROTEAM
SUPERCOACH BACKPACK VACUUM, 10
QT***1210158
02 PROTEAM PT-100565(NO SUBS)
7 03 PROTEAM PTE056550 100 EA $24.80 No Bid SyEielE) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.57 No Bid $31.24
1210160 BAG, VACUUM,TRIANNGLE PAPER,
PROTEAM 10 QT , 10/PK***1210160
01 PRO TEAM
99 OR EQUAL
02 REN 08068
8 03 PT-PRO/10QT 350 PKG $10.76 No Bid
1210408 SPRAYER, TRIGGER, SPRAYER ONLY FOR
320z BOTTLE ONLY ,***1210408
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01S.J.
02 CONTINENTAL
03 NATIONAL 341834
04 CONT 922H
05 TOLCO 110221
06 CONTINENTAL C-922999
07 440080 IMPACT 6900
08 CONTINENTAL 902BW9
9 09 RENOWN IMP6900 252 EA S.65 No Bid S9! No Bid No Bid No Bid S.85 S.69 No Bid S.56
1211435 DISPENSER, PAPER TOWEL ROLL PUSH
BAR, UNIVERSAL FOR 8" DIAM AND 8" WIDE ROLLS,
HEAVY GAUGE STEEL BACK AND IMPACT
RESISTANT PLASTIC FRONT COLOR: TRANSLUCENT
DARK ,**%*1211435
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 PALMER DPT215TS AUTO TRANSFER(NOT
ACCEPTABLE)
02 GEORGIA PACIFIC GPC54338(NO SUBS)
03 GEORGIA PACIFIC GPC54338A (NO SUBS) NEW
10 PART # 50 EA

$41.49

$37.00 No Bid $32.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.82 No Bid No Bid

$38.46

S¥:E] No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.89 $2.65 No Bid No Bid

$45.00 $32.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.33 No Bid $32.19

$6.08 [\ [e}:1le No Bid No Bid §7.99 $6.59 No Bid $8.93

$9.39 I\[eX:1le No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.75 No Bid $18.02

SyyHls) No Bid $39.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.98 $30.67 No Bid $28.74



1211442 TOILET TISSUE, ROLL, WHITE, SINGLE PLY,
1500 SHEET ROLL, SHEET SIZE 3.9 "X4.00", 48
ROLL/CASE **MUST BE PALLETIZED FOR CUSD
DELIVERY** ***1211442
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 TOWEL SAVER NEVEROUT 18N -- 1500/ROLL-48
02 FT. HOWARD #142 -- 1500/ROLL-45 RL/CS
03 #020 ROLLMASTER 48 ROLL/CS 1500 SHTS/RL
04 JAMES RIVER #020
05 JAMES RIVER 18N
06 FORT JAMES
07 ALLIED WEST #585 **NOT ACCEPTABLE**
08 GEORGIA PACIFIC 02002 - SAME AS 19020
(discontinued)
09 SCA #TS1624**NOT ACCEPTABLE***
10 GEORGIA PACIFIC 19020(discontinued) - (18
CASES PER PALLET)
11 E-POLY PAPER STAR TP-1500-IP48(NOT
ACCEPTABLE)
12 GEORGIA PACIFIC PRO ENVISION 14448/01 (
DISTRICT STANDARD)
11 13 TORK 112990 - NOT ACCEPTABLE 1500 CS $53.90 No Bid Syl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $83.26 No Bid $55.79
1211450 GLOVES DISP, NITRILE, LARGE POWDER
FREE, TEXTURED, 100/BOX ,***1211450
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 UNISEAL UNIFLEX # 103-8
02 PINNACLE EPSNITPFL
03 ERNEST GREAT GLOVE
04 SAFETY ZONE GNPR-LG-1
03 ERNEST GREAT GLOVE - NOT TEXTURED -
EPSNITPFL
05 LIFEGUARD 6394 MICRO-TEXTURED
06 CENTRAL SANITARY
07 SKY MED 4 MIL ** NOT ACCEPTABLE**
08 GREDALE - 4MIL ** NOT ACCEPTABLE
09 TOUCH FLEX **NOT ACCEPTABLE
10 PERFECT FIT BY AGNES MEDICAL
11 XANIPURE MEDICAL
12 ZHONG HONG BY PULLIN BRAND
12 13 BASIC SYNGUARD ( NOT ACCEPTABLE) 900 BOX $3.99 No Bid
1211452 GLOVES, DISP, VINYL CLEAR, , MEDIUM,
NON-POWDERED, 100/BOX***1211452
99 OR EQUAL
01 SAFETY ZONE
03 LIFEGUARD 2393
04 ERNEST GREAT GLOVE EPSVINPFM
06 ERNEST GREAT GLOVE VINYL PF
13 07 CENTRAL IP-8607M 200 BX $2.75 No Bid $2.27 $2.34 No Bid No Bid
1211453 GLOVES, DISP, NITRILE, XL POWDER FREE,
TEXTURED, 100/BOX ***1211453
01 ERNEST GREAT GLOVE
99 OR EQUAL
02 CENTRAL SANITARY
03 SKY MED 4 MIL
04 TOUCHFLEX **NOT ACCEPTABLE
05 PERFECT FIT BY AGNES MEDICAL
06 XANIPURE MEDICAL
07 ZHOING HONG BY PULLIN BRAND
14 08 SYNGUARD BASIC(NOT ACCEPTABLE) 400 BOX $3.99 No Bid $3.45
1211454 GLOVES, DISP, NITRILE, MEDUIUM,
POWDER FREE, TEXTURED, 100/BOX***1211454
01 ERNEST GREAT GLOVE
99 OR EQUAL
02 CENTRAL SANITARY
03 SKY MED 4 MIL
04 TOUCHFLEX** NOT ACCEPTABLE
05 PERFECT FIT BY AGNES MEDICAL
06 XANIPURE MEDICAL
07 ZHIONG HONG BY PULLIN BRAND
15 08 SYNGUARD BASIC ( NOT ACCEPTABLE) 300 BOX $3.99 No Bid $3.45
1211455 GLOVES, DISP, NITRILE, SMALL, POWDER
FREE, TEXTURED***1211455
01 ERNEST GREAT GLOVE
99 OR EQUAL
02 CENTRAL SANITARY
03 SKYMED 4 MIL
04 TOUCHFLEX**NOT ACCPETABLE
05 PERFECT FIT BY AGNES MEDICAL
06 XANIPURE MEDICAL
07 ZHONG HONG BY PULLIN BRAND
16 08 SYNGUARD BASIC(NOT ACCEPTABLE) 100 BOX $3.99 No Bid $3.45

SyNYA No Bid No Bid $3.41 $3.95 No Bid $3.74

$2.35 No Bid $2.23

SYNYA No Bid No Bid $3.41 $3.95 No Bid $3.74

SYNd No Bid No Bid $3.41 $3.53 No Bid $3.74

SyN7d No Bid No Bid $3.41 $3.95 No Bid $3.80



3210055 BLEACH, LIQUID, CHLORINE, INDUSTRIAL
STRENGTH, 7% HYPO CHLORITE NOT FOR
CLASSROOM USE **MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
REQUIRED** ,***3210055
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
03 GEORGIA PACIFIC
01 KNAPP
02 ROYAL
04 SERVICE BLEACH
05 CASPACO
06 ALL PURE
07 NSS
08 40D4908
09 CENTRAL AP-GB6X1G
10 KIK INTERNATIONAL
11 FOCUS BLEACH
12 WAXIE 090101
13 DAYBRITE #40F1233 CS/6
14 SW SCHOOL OCCS
15 AFFEX
16 AQUA CHLOR (6/CASE)
17 17 CLOROX CLO30966
3210095 MOP, BOWL, ACRYLON, 10" HANDLE
,¥**3210095
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 SSS
02 BYTECH
03 KNAPP
04 PIONEER
05 WM1301-03
06 BOWL MOP
07 IMPACT F099
08 IMPACT 200
09 CENTRAL BRAND C-790
10 TOLCO 280100
11 IMPACT
12 SSS85101 SOUTHWEST SCHOOL
13 RENOWN REN05138 ( don't re-order)
14 RENOWN RENO05136
15 RM-6310
18 16 RENOWN 1S004 # 311535522
3210101 BROOM, LARGE ANGLE, HOUSEHOLD
PLASTIC BRISTLE UNFLAGGED 60"X13"X2", BRISTLE
TRIM 4 1/2" - MEDIUM ,***3210101
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 BRUSKE PRODUCT
02 FELTON 244708 & 151660
03 NATIONAL 4869-07
04 PIONEER 320
05 PREMIER 60804
06 40C3175 SENIOR WIDE *NOT ACCEPTABLE**
07 FLO PAC 884
08 ACS-B410A
09 CENTRAL BRAND
10 RUBBERMAID FG638906 BLA (6/CASE)
11 ACS 78941
19 12 LG-932A
3210118 FOAM GUN, FOR HOSE HOOK-UP QUICK
SET DIAL FOR MIXING RATIO, QUART SIZE
,¥%%3210118
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 GILMOUR FOAMASTER Il #95QGFMR
02 WAXIE 890701 CREW FOAM GUN
03 HILLYARD
04 DIVERSEY JWP5776027
20 05 H-26320
3210175 BRUSH, SCRUB, SWIVEL ,***3210175 (12
per case, we distribute by the each)
01 FLO PAC POWER SCRUB #5310
02 CARLISLE 356310 (REPL FLO PAC)
03 WAXIE 060115 FLO PAC 5310
04 ACS B7505
05 RENOWN RENO03965 ( 12 per case =) 1.7133 ea
06 TOLCO 280182 (NEW # 230908)
21 07 CARLISLE C-365320

126 GAL

625 EA

84 EA

25 EACH

56 EA

$2.99 No Bid

$.78 No Bid

$4.98 No Bid

$52.99 No Bid

$15.90 No Bid

$3.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SYAE) No Bid $3.11

S%vA No Bid No Bid No Bid $.94 $.81 No Bid S.72

$6.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.15 No Bid $7.74

$52.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.99 No Bid

$6.52 [\[e}:1le No Bid No Bid $6.94 $6.75 No Bid No Bid



3210185 DUSTER, POLY WOOL, 13" LONG,
OVERRALL LENGTH 22", W/ HANDLE ,***3210185
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 990764
02 FRANCIS
03 542115 26" LONG
04 TEXAS
05 TF9443
06 LAMBSKIN S24PPD
07 CENTRAL
08 #312 GENUINE LAMBSWOOL #180160
09 IMPACT 3100
10 CARLISLE 363155
11 GBW 21-L
12 CORP EXPRESS DCSL26
13 RENOWN RENO05261-1B
22 14 BETTER BRUSH 470220 84 EACH $4.99 No Bid $3.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3210186 BUCKET, PLASTIC, 11 QT, GRAY
,¥*%3210186
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 RUBBERMAID 2963
02 CONTINENTAL 8110
03 IMPACT 5510
04 TOLCO 280160
05 RENOWN RENO05147-1B
23 06 C-8110G 47 EA $6.93 No Bid
3210191 ANTIFOAMING AGENT, FOR USE W/
EXTRACTOR EQUIPMENT CLEANER **MATERIAL
SAFETY DATA SHEET REQUIRED** ,***3210191
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 RUG DOCTOR
03 BYTECH DEFOAM
04 PIONEER NO FOAM
05 SSS FOAM ELIMANATOR
06 HILLYARD DEFOAMER
07 NSS 276406
08 KNAPP ANTIFOAM
09 070321 WAXIE DEFOAMER
10 MISSION LAB 2010
11 GENLABS
12 EXSL EX-DEFOAM
13 ULTRA CLEAN 83548 DEFOAM IT
24 14 CHEMCOR 30701 ( 4 GAL PER CASE) 15 EACH $10.90 No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.95 No Bid
3210200 CLEANER, BASIN, LIQUID, CREAM, QUART
**MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET REQUIRED**
,¥*%3210200
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 SCOUR-POWR 151032
02 KNAPP IMPROVED CREAM CLEANSER
03 BYTEC CREME CLEANSER
04 NL CREME CLEANSER
05 TRIGON
06 HILLYARD CREAM CLEAN (NOT ACCEPTABLE)
07 CERTI-MAGIC CREME CLEANSER
08 LSC CREAME CLEANSER
09 EMEREL (JOHNSON)
10 LIQUID SCRUB
11 BUTCHERS DOUBLE PLAY
12 ALLSTAR GENTLE SCRUB
13 BETCO BEST BET #07712
14 GENLABS 0300L
15 CHEMCORE 41312
16 REN02816-MS
25 17 H-106QT 442 BTL $2.80 No Bid
3210201 CLEANER, STAINLESS STEEL, SOY BASED,
CLEANS AND DEGREASES AND POLISHES , READY
TO USE, QUART**#*3210201
01 SOYL1232 SOY TECHNOLOGIES ( NO SUBS)
26 01 SOYL1232 SOY TECHNOLOGIES ( NO SUBS) 25 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.75 No Bid $7.47
3210226 CLEANER, DISINFECTANT AND SANITIZER,
FOR USE WITH GENEON IMMERSE A CLEAN,
CONCENTRATE, GALLON**#*3210226
01 GENEON MINERAL ELECTROLYTE CONCENTRATE
27 99 OR EQUAL 108 GAL $24.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3210227 CLEANER, GLASS , 40 OZ BOTTLE,
CONCENTRATE****3210227
01 GENEON GLASS AND GENEAL -PURPOSE
CLEANING CATALYST CONCENTRATE TO MAKE 400+
GAL
28 99 OR EQUAL 18 BTL $18.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3210235 CLEANER, HEAVY DUTY, ALL PURPOSE, 40
OZ BOTTLE*, CONCENTRATE**3210235
01 GENEON HD ALL PURPOSE CLEANING CATALYST
CONCENTRATE TO MAKE 200+ GALLON
29 99 OR EQUAL 18 EA $20.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3210236 CLEANER, FLOOR CATALYST, 40 OZ
BOTTLE, CONCENTRATE****3210236
01 GENEON GEN-PREP FLOOR CLEANING CATALYST
CONCENTRATE TO MAKE 125+ GAL
30 99 OR EQUAL 11 BTL $21.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$3.75 No Bid No Bid

Sef:ol No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.98 $6.00 No Bid No Bid

SyR-¥A No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.35 No Bid $3.06

YNl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

YK No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Se[0e) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SHlsyA:0] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



31

32

33

3210237 CLEANER, CARPET AND UPHOLSTERY
,CONCENTRATE, 40 OZ BOTTLE****3210237
01 GENEON CARPET-GEN CLEANING CATALYST
99 OR EQUAL

3210240 DEODORANT, ABSORBANT, 1 1/2# JAR,
12/CS **MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
REQUIRED** ,**%3210240

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 SANI-SORB

02 PSI

03 PURO #129

04 WAXIE OOOPS

05 OOOPS

06 HILLYARD 760 SORB-IT

07 BIG D BGD150

09 FLEXON 817742

10 RENOWN REN04001

3210244 TRASH PICK UP TOOL, 32" ,***3210244
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 PARK PATROL PP-32

02 PIPES PEKE

03 GRABBER 6210, 36"

04 WAXIE 293502 GRIP-N-GRAB

05 WAXIE 293480 EASY REACHER

06 EZ REACHER ARC32P-PS-12

07 ARCOA EZ-REACH

08 ARCMATE 325-PS-6

09 EZ-32S

10 BETTER BRUSH 550532 12/PK

11 EZ-REACH

12 214266

3210307 HANDLE, PUSH BROOM, 6', WOOD,
STANDARD THREAD ,***3210307

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 NAT'L 494506

02 FLO PAC #10022

03 SSS 6" REG.

04 6' THREADED

05 PREMIER

06 HARPER

07 WAXIE 050911

08 ACS B1260 (5 ')

09 RUBBERMAID FG36100

10 GOLDENSTAR (12/CASE)

34 11 PREMIER PM-60MTH

35

3210310 DUSTER, POLYWOOL 13"L EXTENSION
POLE TO 84", STEEL HANDLE ,***3210310

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

02 JK IND 400350 **NOT ACCEPTABLE**

03 DUSTER POLYWOOL #180190

04 LS-WLD

05 CENTRAL

06 TEXAS FEATHER 9442

07 CARLISLE 36315600

08 LAMBSKIN (NOT ACCEPTABLE)

09 GBW

10 RDI SP85 POLYDUSTER

11 RENOWN RENO05260V

12 RENOWN REN052260-1B

13 RENOWN REN 05261-1B

3210334 VANDALISM REMOVER, CITRUS BASE,
**NOT TO REMOVE PAINT**, QUART DILUTABLE
,¥*%3210334

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL

05 GRAFFITI X #420 QT (PREFERRED)

08 PINNACLE GRAFFITI REMOVER

09 FLOKEM 11323

11 SSS83682 GRAFFITI REMOVER I

12 SPA3171-12

36 13 CLARE CL-310

3210336 INSECTICIDE, WASP & HORNET SPRAY, 15
0z, ***MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
REQUIRED*** ,***3210336

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 AMREP CL-013

02 ALLSTAR 40H7666

03 CHAMPION

04 CHASE SPRAYPAK 4334108

05 SPARTAN SPA6820 14 OZ

06 SPECTRACIDE 20 OZ 50389

37 07 750389

10 EA

223 JAR

117 EA

47 EACH

127 EA

48 QUAR

105 EA

$22.71 No Bid

$2.99 No Bid

$9.90 No Bid

$2.39 No Bid

$6.80 No Bid

SEll0) No Bid

$5.75 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$5.42 No Bid

$8.20 No Bid

SyN Il No Bid

Sy2s1) No Bid

$6.67 No Bid

SEfVA No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SHPIRE) No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4.69

$4.75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SyA°kE No Bid

$8.15 No Bid

$2.99 No Bid

$5.15 No Bid

No Bid

$4.80 No Bid

No Bid
S3.24
$10.42
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
S5.27



3210337 LUBRICANT, SILICONE SPRAY, 11 OZ/CAN
**MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET REQUIRED**
,¥*%3210337
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 KNAPP
02 SILICONE LUBE
03 NATIONAL 305012 SLICK - 19 OZ
04 SSS
05 LUBE ALL 11 OZ
06 40H5361 ALL STAR SLICK 11 OZ
07 WD-40 10141
08 WAXIE 410371 LUBE-ALL
09 CHAMPION 4385158
10 CHASE SPRAYPAk 4385158 12 OZ
11 CLAIR CL948
12 RADIATOR SPECIALTY LIQUID WRENCH M914
13 RENOWN 05015-AM
38 14 SPARTAN LUBE ALL 20 Oz
3210350 SCOURING PAD, HAND, NYLON, 10/BOX,
#96 GREEN ,***3210350
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 SSS 96
02 3M 96
03 NSS 96
04 CLEANWAY #2
05 CONTINENTAL 96
06 GLID 96
07 GLIT 96B
08 PREMIER 196
09 SSS REGULAR
10 MICROTRON ABRASIVES
11 CENTRAL C-96
12 ACS S096
13 NORTON 961668
14 CARLISLE 36386
15 PIONEER #96A
39 16 RENOWN REN02114
3210393 SOAP, LIQUID HAND SOAP 800ML
,¥*%3210393
01 GOJO 9128-12 PINK & KLEAN REFILL (12 PER
40 CASE)
SPONGE SCRUBBER 3" X 6" X 2" #74 ,***3210397
41
3210405 FRAME, DUST MOP, 18" DETACHABLE,
CLIP-ON ,***3210405
01 NSS 472918
02 518-2 WILEN 34888 **NOT ACCEPTABLE**
03 PIONEER 5X18"
04 PREMIER
05 ALL STAR 40C3248 (REPLACES LINE 1)
06 WAXIE 650812
07 CARLISLE
08 RUBBERMAID FGM2520(12/CASE)
09 GOLDENSTAR
10 RENOWN REN-02612-1B
42 11 PM-518F
3210404 GUM REMOVER, COOLANT SPRAY, 6 OZ
AEROSOL **MATERIAL SAFETY DATA SHEET
REQUIRED** ,***3210404
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 KNAPP
04 PIONEER
02 BYTEC
03 PIONEER GUM REMOVER
05 HILLYARD GUM & GO
06 PIONEER-CHEM MIST GUM REMOVER
07 SSS CITRISOLVE *NO LONGER ACCEPTABLE*
08 HILLYARD,CITRUS SCRUB *NOT ACCEPTABLE*
09 SSS GUM REMOVER
10 CHAMPION
11 CLAIRE
12 CHASE SPRAY PAK 5.5 oz
13 CENTRAL K-CGR 5.5 0Z
14 WAXIE #070451 -6 OZ
15 CLAIR PRO SERIES CS-241 6.5 OZ
43 16 RENOWN 05012-AM

58 CAN

326 PK

13 EACH

778 EACH

20 EA

98 CAN

$9.90 No Bid

$2.50 No Bid

$6.95 No Bid

$.75 No Bid

$2.25 No Bid

$4.30 No Bid

$6.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.75 No Bid $5.09
$4.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid §2.33 $3.65 No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SEN0] No Bid No Bid
$.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid $.70 %78 No Bid $.69

SIWE] No Bid No Bid $4.99 $3.89 $2.00 No Bid $4.35

$3.77 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.15 No Bid No Bid




3210436 SQUEEGEE, BLADE ONLY, 12 INCH FOR
STECCONE, ***3210436
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 STECCONE 3952-12
02 CONTINENTAL 12" BLADE
03 RR30 UNGER 34430
04 PCB 283-R12
05 UNGER 12" REFILL #290420
06 RR 306
07 FLO PAC 203R12
08 CARLISLE 36283R12
09 PTX71230
10 WAXIE 290420
11 CENTRAL SE-12R REFILL
12 LAMBSKIN WPSR12
44 13 UNGER UNGRT300 11 EA $2.50 No Bid $1.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 No Bid
3210437 SQUEEGEE, I8 INCH BRASS W/RUBBER
BLADE ***3210437
01 ETTORE 10018
99 OR EQUAL
45 02 HAVILAND 18 46 EA
3210438 SQUEEGEE, 18 INC SS W/RUBBER BLADE
(BVRASS NO LONGER AVAIL OCT
2022)***32110438
46 01 ETTORE 10012 45 EA No Bid No Bid $10.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.45 No Bid $6.93
3210460 FLOOR FINISH, TILE, FOR HIGH-SPEED
FLOOR BURNISHING MACHINES, 5 GALLON CAN,
MUST EXCEED 22% SOLIDS **MATERIAL SAFETY
DATA SHEET REQUIRED** ,***3210460
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
05 JOHNSON VECTRA **NO LONGER
ACCEPTABLE**
07 ONCE-A-YEAR FLOOR FINISH (CHAMPION)(NOT
ACCEPT)
09 PIONEER IRON COAT **NO LONGER
ACCEPTABLE**
10 SUR TEC ULTRA GLOSS 99 (2X2.5GAL)
11 SURTEC IRON PLATE
47 14 SURTEC ULTRA GLOSS AC530025 84 CAN $79.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3210482 SANITARY NAPKINS, 3"X1"X4.5" 250/CS,
FOR MODESS 4N DISPENSER ,***3210482
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 MODESS 4
02 STAYFREE #4
03 KOTEX 4-704 (200/CS)
04 #147 GARDS
05 HOSP. SPEC. MTR MAXITHINS CS/250
06 MAXITHINS #4 820020
07 ROCHESTER
08 GARDS #4
48 09 HOSPECO HOSMT-4 31 CS
3210489 TAMPONS, 500/CS ,***3210489
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
03 TAMPAX T500
04 R-TAMPONS
05 RMC TAMPON
06 PLAYTEX GENTLE GLIDE,PLASTIC 300/CASE
49 (PREFERRED BRAND) 12 CS $65.80 No Bid $74.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.98 $66.19 No Bid
3210541 GLOVES, RUBBER, SIZE 8 (MEDIUM)
CHEMICAL RESISTANT, FLOCK LINED HEAVY DUTY
,¥¥%3210541
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 IMPACT 527
02 IMPACT XIM8448M
03 IMPACT 8448
04 IMPACT 75E2866 DZ/BX
05 SAFETY ZONE - GALAXY 192
06 LIFEGUARD
07 JOHNSON WILSHIRE
08 TRONEX 1908-20
09 IMPACT 880563
10 CORDOVA - YELLOW
11 CORDOVA SAFETY
50 12 IMPACT IP-8440M 103 PR $.70 No Bid $.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid $.68
3210555 CAN, TRASH, PLASTIC, 32 GAL, GRAY W/O
LID ,***3210555
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 RUBBERMAID #2632 GRA
02 #3200 HUSKEE
03 CONTINENTAL 3200G
04 WHITE
51 05 CARLISLE 182 EA $23.99 No Bid $22.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.10 $24.80 No Bid
3210563 BUCKET, PLASTIC, FINISH SYSTEM,
RECTANGLE, 14.7LX26.2WX16.2H WITH CASTERS
AND LID ,***3210563
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
04 RUBBERMAID Q930 BLUE(NO SUBS)
52 05 RUBBERMAID Q930 BLUE 16 EA $69.90 No Bid $101.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid

$16.90 L\eR:]ls! $15.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.79 $18.25 No Bid No Bid

$95.00 $47.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.98 $36.79 No Bid $48.98

S¥¥4 No Bid $1.65

$77.36 No Bid $97.19



3210579 TOILET TISSUE, SINGLE PLY JUMBO, 6
RLS/CASE 4000' PER ROLL ,***3210579
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
02 JAMES RIVER
01 KC-7202
03 ALLIED WEST #510
04 FORT JAMES
05 KIMBERLY CLARK 7202-10
06 STEFCO
07 ANP
08 ALL NATION 121JT30
09 GEORGIA PACIFIC 13105
10 VONDREHLE
11 ERNEST
12 TFT-JRT640001
13 GPT13718 (8ROLLS PER CASE) AND 2000 FT
ROLLS
14 MOREX JRT 1 PLY
53 15 ROYALTY SJSSRT4000 6 CS $67.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.89 No Bid
3210620 PADS, FLOOR 20" GREEN LITE SCRUBBER,
5/CS ,***3210620
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
08 ETC
03 3M
04 S.J.S.
05 SSS 20" GREEN
06 3M20B
07 265133 20" 3M
09 CENTRAL BRAND
10 AMERICO 400320
11 ACS
54 12 3-M20GEA 30 CS $13.18 No Bid
3210640 SCRUBBER POLE DOODLEBUG W/ HANDLE
,¥*%3210640
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
013M
05 CENTRAL
02 #6472W
03 PREMIER
04 ETC
06 AMERICO
07 UNISOURCE AMERICO U19370
08 UNISOURCE 10369693
09 RUBBERMAID 6361 HANDLE/ACS618 HODLER
10 POLE 289935/PAD HOLDER YYY405
11 REN02097&03985
12 IMPACT IMP 20000+ 01101
13 DOODLEBUG G-6472GB AND IMPACT HANDLE
55 PM-60 TH GOLDENSTAR 61 EACH
3211100 BAGS, TRASH, 28 QT, 24X23 .45 MIL, STAR
BOTTOM,BLACK, CS/500,***3211100
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 POLYSTAR PSL-2423-45B
02 REP-2423 (CENTRAL SANITARY)
03 WARDLEY 15X9X23 .45 MILSTAR BOTTOM
04 ALLSTATE
05 OCEANIA 24X23 .45 BLACK STAR BOTTOM
06 INTERBORO INT2423 (BID A)
56 07 WAXIE 700545 29 CS $16.00 $32.00 No Bid
3211101 BAGS, TRASH, 36 QT, 24"X32" .45 MIL,
STAR BOTTOM, BLACK, CS/500 ,***3211101
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
04 ALLSTATE
01 POLYSTAR PSL-2432-45B
02 WARDLEY STAR BOTTOM
03 CENTRAL REP-2432
06 INT 2432-HVY
57 07 243245LDBK BLACK 214 CS $15.90 $22.00 No Bid $17.82 No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.75 No Bid
3211102 BRUSH, DECK, 10" LONG, WITH PLASTIC
BLOCK, POLY PROPYLENE FIBERS ,***3211102
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 RUBBERMAID #6337 BLU
02 CARLISLE 36193P
03 WAXIE 060320
04 ACSB7110W
05 RENOWN REN 03953
58 06 WAXIE 2066306 39 EA $8.99 No Bid $7.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
3211103 BROOM, LOBBY, NYLON UTILITY 30"
HANDLE, ANGULAR BRISTLES ,***3211103
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 PREMIER FO79 **NOT ACCEPTABLE**
02 FLO PAC U18281
03 ACS B44IL
04 CARLISLE #3685914
05 WAXIE 051261 DUAL ANGLE
06 RUBBERMAID 6374 35"
07 GOLDENSTAR
59 08 RENOWN 039433 98 EA $4.29 No Bid $5.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Syaelo) No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.05 No Bid No Bid $12.43

SHHE0) No Bid $10.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.79 $27.15 No Bid No Bid

SEEW/Z No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.10 No Bid No Bid

$4.65 No Bid No Bid

$4.05 No Bid $8.43



3211104 BRUSH, COUNTER, CLASSROOM, 8" 2 1/2
TRIM BLACK TAMPICO W/ PLASTIC BLOCK
J¥*%3211104

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 #258 COUNTER #060250

02 HARPER

03 CARLISLE 3621959

04 ACS B7708

05 RUBBERMAID FG634100BLA 6/CASE

06 CARLISLE C-3625803

60 07 RENOWN REN03943

3211105 BRUSH, CARPET SPOTTING, 10" WOOD
BLOCK, NYLON BRISTLE SCRAPER HANDLE END
,¥*%3211105

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 FLO PAC 257N

02 WAXIE 060650

03 CARLISLE C--36257WN ( discontinued)

61 04 BETTER BRUSH 230310 12/CASE

3211112 DUST PAN, LONG HANDLE, PLASTIC LARGE
CAPACITY - APPROX 1 CUBIC FOOT ,***3211112

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 MCLANE(PREFERRED)

02 RUBBERMAID

62 03 BETTER BRUSH 410112

3211113 HANDLE, MOP, WOOD, 63" QUICK
CHANGE, METAL HEAD ,***3211113

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 KNAPP JO49

02 PM-HQC83 CENTRAL

03 PREMIER 401-12

04 ACS M8941

05 RUBBERMAID FGH516000000 (12/CASE)
06 GOLDENSTAR

07 ACS-B770B

08 PM-HQC83

63 09 311594768

3211115 HANDLE, TELESCOPING, 18FT 3 SECTIONS,
STD. THREAD, ANODIZED ALUM. ,***3211115

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 UNGER FLP18

02 FLO PAC 318T

03 CARLISLE 41014

04 EAGLE 2550-181 PXP03600

05 WAXIE 291140 ETTORE REACH

06 CONTINENTAL C-2550-18

64 07 RENOWN RENO03885

3211116 BRUSH, WALL, LOOP 5"X12" L
,¥**3211116

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 UNGER #WALB

02 FLO PAC111

03 CARLISLE 36111

04 CONTINENTAL 255DCD

65 05 CENTRAL

3211118 MOP, RAYON, TO APPLY FINISH TO FIT 18"
DUST MOP FRAME, FLAT ,***3211118

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 RUBBERMAID EQ52**

02 GOLDEN STAR AJU18FN (PREFERRED)

03 PREMIER 13503 (NOT ACCEPTABLE 7/10)

04 TUW33M-182L

05 WAXIEGREEN -NOT ACCEPTABLE - MICROFIBER

66 PAD

3211119 MOP BUCKET, W/ WRINGER 35 QT
PLASTIC, 3" CASTERS, 16-320z DOWN PRESS
WRINGER ,***3211119

99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.

01 RUBBERMAID #7577

02 CONTINENTAL #660027C

03 WP-6000/2635

04 CONTINENTAL 335-37BL

05 IMPACT 7Y-126363Y (NOT ACCEPTABLE)
06 CONTINENTAL 335-312BLS

07 RUBBERMAID 7580-88

08 CENTRAL BRAND

09 QUILLS BRIGHTON

10 PINNACLE 33537YW

11 CARLISLE C-335-37YW

12 CARLISLE 3690504

67 13 APEAL APP15501

13 EA

74 EA

47 EA

51 EA

7 EA

66 EA

36 EA

19 EA

$6.90 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$17.99 No Bid

$6.69 No Bid

§77.65 No Bid

SHReEl No Bid

SR No Bid

$79.90 No Bid

$5.65 No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$6.99 No Bid

SYEREE) No Bid

$17.75 No Bid

No Bid No Bid

SYRE[S) No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$12.49

$3.32

No Bid

No Bid

$4.99

$8.99

$9.15

$23.98 No Bid

$8.99

$122.98

SyA°kE No Bid

1A No Bid

$9.15 No Bid

$6.45 [\ [eR:1le

$73.21 No Bid

No Bid

$15.79 No Bid

$135.26 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$20.02

$9.40

$49.95

$21.77

$17.39

$89.47



3211120 SEAT COVER, 1/2 FOLD CS/5000
,¥%%3211120
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 LIFEGUARD
02 GENERIC
03 ROCHESTER
04 CENTRAL 046
05 FOCUS BRAND
06 HOSPECO 851557
07 SW# 86535C
08 CENTRAL INTEGRITY
09 MOREXT TSC20250
10 HFOLD5000
11 GP-47046
12 ROYALTY RPHFTSC20P
68 13 309330283 182 CS
3211122 PAD, DOODLEBUG SCRUB'N STRIP BLACK,
4"X10", BX/5 ,***3211122
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 GLIT BLACK
02 GLIT/MICROTRON 22506
03 ETC
04 CENTRAL
05 AMERICO
06 ACS 672
69 07 3-M8550 48 BX $3.43 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75
3211123 MOP, SUPER LOOP BLEND, LARGE 4 PLY,
5" HEAD BAND W/ TAILBAND LAUNDRABLE
,¥*%3211123
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 LG "UNSHRINKABLE" SUPERLOOP #650331
02 ACS M8711
03 GOLDENSTAR AST34BL5
04 CORP EXPRESS CMCA02503
05 CENTRAL PM-SCLR & PM-HQC83
06 TRIPLE S GOLDENSTAR 37033
07 RENOWN REN02397
08 PM-SCLR
70 09 RENOWN RA11103# 312376399 151 EA
3211124 SQUEEGE BLADE ONLY, FOR STECCONE
18" ,***3211124
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 UNGER RR45C
02 PULEX PXT71845
03 CARLISLE 36283CR1800
04 ETTORE 290430
05 LAMBSKIN WPSR18
06 UNGER UNGRT450
07 RENOWN REN03872
71 08 GO-REFILL 18 EA $1.80 No Bid
3211125 SQUEEGE, FLOOR, FOAM TYPE, 22" BLACK
MOSS RUBBER, HANDLE NOT INCL. HEAVY DUTY
,¥*%3211125
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 UNGER HM22
02 UNGER HM550
03 UNGER UG-MW?22
04 ETTORE WAXIE #297010
05 ETTORE 1636
06 RUBBERMAID FGC27BLA
07 CARLISLE36632400
72 08 APPEAL APP18139 39 EA $7.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.99 $15.35 No Bid
3211126 BAGS, SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL KRAFT
WAXED PAPER, WALL MOUNT CS/250 ,***3211126
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 IMPACT 260 #30C0431
02 HOSPECO C-250K
03 WAXIE 820715 - (250 pk do not re-order)
04 ROCHESTER
05 HOSPECO HOS260 500/CASE
73 06 HOSPECO HOSHS-6141 52 CS
3211127 WAX STRIPPER, 2.5 GAL CAN ,***3211127
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 PIONEER ECLIPSE FORMULA X UHP *NO SUBS*
02 FLASH 55 FLOOR STRIPPER (REPLACES FORMULA
74 X) 23 CN
3211128 VANDALISM REMOVER, WIPES 30/TUB
,¥*¥*3211128
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 DYMON #901(discontinue)
02 WAXIE GRAFFITI WIPES #410240 TUB/45
03 CLAIR CL963 40 PER TUB
04 DYMON AB-DYC901
75 05 RENOWN RENO05062 ( 6 per case) 19 TUB $12.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SyyXelil No Bid $27.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.99 $34.19 No Bid $31.49

Sefel) No Bid $23.49

SENC) No Bid $3.90 No Bid No Bid $10.98 $5.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid

SiNy4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.85 No Bid $2.17

SHvAco) No Bid $19.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.99 $18.66 No Bid $19.28

Ss:9000) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

S No Bid $92.67



3211129 GLOVES, NITRILE, SIZE 9 (LARGE) 13
LENGTH, CHEMICAL RESISTANT, FLOCK LINED,
HEAVY DUTY, 18 MIL THICK ,***3211129
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 IMPACT #8217L
02 CENTRAL NITRILE SAFETY ZONE GRFY-LG-IS
03 JOHNSON WILSHIRE
04 SAFETY ZONE GNGF-LG-15C
76 05 CORDOVA YELLOW 109 PR
3211130 GLOVES, NITRILE, SIZE 10 (X-LARGE) 13"
LENGTH, CHEMICAL RESISTANT, FLOCK LINED,
HEAVY DUTY, 18 MIL THICK ,***3211130
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
02 CENTRAL NITRILE SAFETY ZONE GRFY-LG-IS
01 IMPACT 8217XL
03 SAFETY ZONE GNGF-XL-15C
04 JOHNSON WILSHIRE 94530
77 05 CORDOVA YELLOW 154 PR
3211133 SCRAPER, LONG HANDLE, 4" BLADE W/
4'(FOOT) HANDLE, HEAVY DUTY, BLADE TO BE
REPLACABLE ,***3211133
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 UNGER #LH48
02 UNGER LONG HANDLE SCRAPER #290750
03 STANLEY
04 WARNER TOOL 786521
05 BETTER BRUSH
78 06 RENOWN 03881-1B 41 EA $20.90 No Bid
3211134 DISPENSER, TOILET TISSUE, ROLL SINGLE,
ROLL CONTROL LOCK (STUDENT) ,***3211134
01 BOBRICK B-273/806581
79 99 NO SUBS 6 CS
3211136 HOSE, 5/8" X 25' 4 PLY, (INSIDE USE ONLY)
,¥*%3211136
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 GILMORE
02 IMPACT 7650
03 CONTINENTAL 10HL (144 PER CASE)
04 FLEXON 817827
05 FLEXON 817742
80 06 GR-1864 16 EA
3211350 DISPENSER, PUMP, 1 OZ. MEASURE, USED
WITH 5 GAL. CONTAINER ,***3211350
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 CONTINENTAL #1800-HL
02 CONTINENTAL 890210C
03 #9HL (CM9HL)
04 OUNCE-A-MATIC #3440
05 NATIONAL 344005
06 IMPACT 904-100 C9
07 TOLCO 160108
08 CONTINENTAL 10HL
81 09 RENOWN RENO05110 23 EA $5.99 No Bid
3211351 DISPENSER, 1 OZ MEASURE, FOR ONE
GALLON CAN ,***3211351
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 CONTINENTAL
02 #9 JUG PUMP
03 IMPACT
04 TOLCO 160100
05 WAXIE 890210C

SHvL) No Bid $1.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $.72 $1.36 No Bid $1.65

SHvL) No Bid $1.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid $.72 $1.36 No Bid $1.65

$8.96 [\ [e}:1le No Bid No Bid $9.79 $17.95 No Bid $13.17

SyLell No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $197.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid

syLRelo) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

AL No Bid No Bid No Bid §2.19 $2.57 No Bid §2.71

82 06 RENOWN REN 05110 57 EA $2.40 No Bid $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.05 $2.49 No Bid No Bid
3211352 XXL LAUNDRY DETERGENT, LIQUID ( HE), 5
GAL***3211352
01 CHE70705
83 99 OR EQUAL 42 5 GA S{:N0lo) No Bid $71.99 No Bid $93.00 No Bid No Bid $165.21 No Bid $§27.30

3211999 CLEANING CLOTH, MICROFIBER, BLUE
12X12, 12/PK***3211999
99 OR EQUAL
01 RENOWN REN03692-1B
02 APPEAL APP18201 (14x14)
03 309555847 RENOWN 01212-BLZ
84 04 MONARCH M9151112 140 PKG
3212040 HOSE, GARDEN, 5/8" ID X 50' PLASTIC
(OUTSIDE USE ONLY) ,***3212040
99 OR APPROVED EQUAL.
01 GRAINGER 1P648
02 GOODRICH KOROSEAL
03 SWAN 21010
04 NATIONAL 728034
05 VERMONT AMERICAN 79831
06 SWAN FA5850 (40g3282)
07 TOLCO 210101
08 WAXIE 890350 NEVERKINK
09 FLEXON 817742
10 IMPERIAL 8424050
85 11 TEKNOR 8617- fFLEXIBLE CRSH RESISTENT 90 EA $36.50 No Bid

S4.68 \[eR:1le $5.29 No Bid No Bid $8.98 $5.88 $6.61 No Bid $5.06

SivAPA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.39



3219500 SOAP, HAND, LIQUID, FOAMING,
GALLON***3219500
01 GENLABS FOAMING SOAP
02 CENTRAL MAINTEX
03 CHEMCOR FOAMING HAND SOAP
04 GENLABS GLS090604-016

86 05 EX-H2131
3219501 DISPENSER, FOAM SOAP***3219501
01 IMP9326 BLACK (DISTRICT STANDARD)

87 99 NO SUBS
1210159 BAG, VACUUM, PAPER, FOR PROTEAM
SUPERCOACH BAKPACK VACUUM, 10 QT,
10/PKG***1210159
02 PROTEAM 100331(NO SUBS)

88 03 RENOWN RENO08051 EQUIVALENT TO 100331

1130 GAL

54 EA

500 PK

$7.10 No Bid

$17.50 No Bid

$10.56 No Bid

No Bid

SYAE) No Bid

No Bid

SieRelel No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$16.99

$8.49 No Bid

SHiE(S) No Bid

$10.04 No Bid

$9.29

$18.14

$12.34



